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Highlights 
1. EBA updates estimates of the Basel III implementation impact, and the effect on the EU economy 

2. EBA publishes annual report on risk and vulnerabilities of the EU banking system 

3. ESAs issue draft RTS on non-cleared OTC derivatives and statement on fallbacks for OTC derivatives 

4. Council of the EU adopts review of supervisory framework, sets objectives to deepen CMU and priorities to                 

reform AML 

5. BoE, PRA and FCA issue co-ordinated consultation papers on operational resilience 

 

EUROPE 

▰ EBA issues second part of its advise on the implementation of Basel III 
Includes the impact of market risk framework and CVA. Minimum capital requirements expected to increase 23.6%                
for the full sample (capital shortfall is about €124.8 billion). Estimated ​macroeconomic impact is positive.  

▰ EBA publishes its annual report on risks and vulnerabilities in the EU banking sector  

Shows​: i) solvency ratios remains stable, ii) banks assets rise considerably, iii) NPL ratio continues improving, iv)                 
capital ratios remain unchanged, v) profitability remains at low levels, vi) operational risks still high. 

▰ ESAs issue draft RTS on non-cleared OTC derivatives and statement on fallbacks for OTC derivatives 

RTS to amend delegated regulation on ​risk mitigation techniques for non-cleared OTC derivatives. Statement on               
the introduction of fallbacks in OTC derivative contracts. Both seek to enhance consistency with global framework.  

▰ Council of the EU adopts a review of the supervisory framework for financial institutions 
The ​text reviews tasks, powers, governance and funding of the ESAs and the ESRB, so as to adapt the authorities                    
to the changed context in which they operate and reinforces EBA’s role on AML activities.  

▰ Council of the EU sets objectives on the deepening of the CMU 

Main ​objectives​: i) access to finance; ii) removal of capital flows barriers; iii) removal of obstacles for retail savers to                    
invest; iv) sustainable economies; v) technological progress and digitalization; and vi) global competitiveness. 

▰ Council of the EU sets strategic priorities for further reforms on AML  

Urges for: i) swift transposition and effective implementation of all AML legislation into national law, ii) ways of                  
ensuring a more robust and effective cooperation and exchange of information between relevant authorities. 

▰ ECB issues list of banks will be directly supervised by ECB in 2020  
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https://eba.europa.eu/eba-updates-estimates-impact-implementation-basel-iii-and-provides-assessment-its-effect-eu-economy
https://eba.europa.eu/eba-confirms-progress-banks%E2%80%99-balance-sheet-repair-points-bleak-outlook-their-profitability
https://eba.europa.eu/emir-rts-various-amendments-bilateral-margin-requirements-and-joint-statement-introduction-fall
https://www.consilium.europa.eu/en/press/press-releases/2019/12/02/financial-supervision-council-adopts-a-review-of-the-supervisory-framework-for-financial-institutions/
https://www.consilium.europa.eu/en/press/press-releases/2019/12/05/capital-markets-union-council-sets-objectives-for-the-deepening-of-the-project/?utm_source=dsms-auto&utm_medium=email&utm_campaign=Capital+markets+union%3a+Council+sets+objectives+for+the+deepening+of+the+project
http://data.consilium.europa.eu/doc/document/ST-14823-2019-INIT/en/pdf?utm_source=dsms-auto&utm_medium=email&utm_campaign=Money+laundering%3a+Council+sets+strategic+priorities+for+further+reforms


 
Number of ​banks decreased from 119 to 117 due to: new group structures, licence withdrawal, business                
relocations because of Brexit, regulatory changes and other developments. List considers all developments up to 1                
Nov 2019. 

▰ ESMA publishes final report on draft RTS under the Prospectus regulation 

The ​draft RTS to this final report amend the relevant provisions in the Delegated Regulation where clerical and                  
minor errors have been identified. ESMA will submit this final report to the European Commission. 

▰ ESMA issues guidance on registering securitisation repositories 

Provides information on it’s registration process to companies that intend to apply to become a repository under the                  
Securitisation Regulation (includes submission format, and deadlines of application). 

▰ ESMA issues consultation on guidelines on internal controls for CRAs 

Invites ​comments on issues related to internal controls for CRAs and alternatives it should consider. Deadline: 16                 
Mar 2020. 

▰ ESMA publishes compliance table with guidelines on stress test under the MMF regulation 

It ​presents the list of competent authorities that comply or intend to comply with the guidelines on stress test                   
scenarios under the Money Market Fund Regulation. 

▰ ESMA publishes 2019 CRA market share calculation in the EU 

It aims to facilitate issuers and related third parties to find ​CRAs with market share under 10%, as CRA Regulation,                    
requires them to consider appointing a CRA with no more than 10% total market share. 

▰ ESMA updates several Q&As  

Updates Q&As on: i) ​Prospectus regulation on disclosure annexes; ii) ​AIFMD on liquidity stress test reporting; iii)                 
MIFID II and MIFIR on investor protection, iv) ​benchmarks regulation with common supervisory approaches and               
practices; and v) ​CSDR​ on practical implementation issues. 

▰ EIOPA consults on approaches to regulate Pan-European Personal Pension Product (PEPP) 

Sets out​: i) information documents; ii) cost cap; iii) risk-mitigation techniques, iv) supervisory reporting and               
cooperation between NCAs and EIOPA; iv) product intervention powers. Deadline: 2 Mar 2020. 
 

SPAIN 

▰ BdE approves the accounting ​Circular​ for financial credit facilities (EFC in Spanish) 

It constitutes the ​accounting regime for EFC, concluding the interim regime. Seeks convergence of the accounting                
standards with the European framework conformed by IFRS adopted in EU. Entry into force: 1 Jan 2020. 
 

UNITED KINGDOM 

▰ BoE, PRA and FCA issue co-ordinated consultation papers on operational resilience 

Presents new ​requirements to strengthen operational resilience making clear that firms and FMIs are expected to                
prioritise plans and investment choices based on their impacts on the public interest. Deadline: 2 Apr 2020. 
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https://www.bankingsupervision.europa.eu/press/pr/date/2019/html/ssm.pr191204~45bda0701a.en.html
https://www.esma.europa.eu/document/esma-amendments-rts-relating-pr
https://www.esma.europa.eu/sites/default/files/library/guidance_sr_registration.pdf
https://www.esma.europa.eu/press-news/consultations/consultation-guidelines-internal-controls-cras
https://www.esma.europa.eu/sites/default/files/library/esma34-49-176_confirmation_of_compliance_with_guidelines_-_mmf_stress_test_guidelines.pdf
https://www.esma.europa.eu/press-news/esma-news/esma-publishes-2019-cra-market-share-calculation-in-eu
https://www.esma.europa.eu/press-news/esma-news/esma-updates-its-qas-relating-prospectus-regulation-0
https://www.esma.europa.eu/press-news/esma-news/esma-updates-aifmd-qa-0
https://www.esma.europa.eu/press-news/esma-news/esma-updates-qas-mifid-ii-and-mifir-investor-protection-and-intermediaries-3
https://www.esma.europa.eu/press-news/esma-news/esma-updates-its-bmr-qas
https://www.esma.europa.eu/press-news/esma-news/esma-updates-csdr-qas-7
https://eiopa.europa.eu/Pages/News/EIOPA-publicly-consults-on-its-approaches-for-regulating-key-aspects-of-the-Pan-European-Personal-Pension-Product.aspx
https://www.bde.es/f/webbde/GAP/Secciones/SalaPrensa/NotasInformativas/19/presbe2019_76.pdf
https://www.bankofengland.co.uk/news/2019/december/building-operational-resilience-impact-tolerances-for-import-business-services?utm_source=Bank+of+England+updates&utm_campaign=208735fe6a-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2019_12_05_10_27&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_556dbefcdc-208735fe6a-113461697


 
 

UNITED STATES 

▰ Agencies issue statement on the use of alternative data in credit underwriting  

Notes the benefits of using ​alternative data (information not typically found in credit reports) for consumers (e.g.                 
expands access to credit and enables them to obtain additional products and more favorable terms). 

▰ Agencies issue guidance on requirements for financial services to hemp-related businesses 

States that banks are ​no longer required to file Suspicious Activity Reports solely because a customer is engaged                  
in the growth or cultivation of hemp. Banks are expected to file a SAR if indicia of suspicious activity warrants. 

▰ FDIC consults on its regulatory cost-benefit analysis approach 

Seeks ​comments on the approaches it uses, or that is considering to use, to analyze the effects of its regulatory                    
actions. Deadline: 28 Jan 2020. 

▰ CFPB issues consultation relating to remittance rule 

Proposes to allow certain institutions to provide estimates of certain fees and exchange rates when it could be                  
economically infeasible to provide exact disclosures. Deadline: 45 days after publication in the Federal Register. 

▰ FDIC issues list of banks examined for CRA compliance and evaluation schedules 

Presents: i) the list of state banks evaluated for ​CRA compliance in Dec 2019; and ii) list of institutions selected for                     
CRA evaluation​ for the first and second quarter of 2020. 
 

Recent publications of interest (in English and Spanish): 

▰ Press Article​. ​Provisions for non-performing loans: how much is enough?​ August 2019. 

▰ Press Article​. ​Climate Change: Tempus Fugit​. September 2019. 

▰ Press Article​. ​The Banking union: something's at play. ​November 2019. 

Previous edition of our Weekly Financial Regulation Update in ​English  
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https://www.federalreserve.gov/newsevents/pressreleases/bcreg20191203b.htm
https://www.federalreserve.gov/newsevents/pressreleases/bcreg20191203a.htm
https://www.fdic.gov/news/news/press/2019/pr19116.html
https://www.consumerfinance.gov/about-us/newsroom/cfpb-issues-notice-proposed-rulemaking-remittance-rule/
https://www.fdic.gov/news/news/press/2019/pr19118.html
https://www.fdic.gov/news/news/press/2019/pr19113.html
https://www.bbva.com/en/opinion/provisions-for-non-performing-loans-how-much-is-enough/
https://www.bbvaresearch.com/en/publicaciones/climate-change-tempus-fugit/?utm_source=linkedin&utm_medium=social&utm_campaign=rrssresearch&utm_term=30092019
https://www.bbva.com/en/opinion/the-banking-union-somethings-at-play/
https://www.bbvaresearch.com/en/publicaciones/financial-regulation-weekly-update-29-november-2019/


 
DISCLAIMER 

This document has been prepared by BBVA Research Department. It is provided for information purposes only and                 
expresses data, opinions or estimations regarding the date of issue of the report, prepared by BBVA or obtained                  
from or based on sources we consider to be reliable, and have not been independently verified by BBVA.                  
Therefore, BBVA offers no warranty, either express or implicit, regarding its accuracy, integrity or correctness. 

Any estimations this document may contain have been undertaken according to generally accepted methodologies              
and should be considered as forecasts or projections. Results obtained in the past, either positive or negative, are                  
no guarantee of future performance. 

This document and its contents are subject to changes without prior notice depending on variables such as the                  
economic context or market fluctuations. BBVA is not responsible for updating these contents or for giving notice of                  
such changes. 

BBVA accepts no liability for any loss, direct or indirect, that may result from the use of this document or its                     
contents. 

This document and its contents do not constitute an offer, invitation or solicitation to purchase, divest or enter into                   
any interest in financial assets or instruments. Neither shall this document nor its contents form the basis of any                   
contract, commitment or decision of any kind. 

With regard to investment in financial assets related to economic variables this document may cover, readers                
should be aware that under no circumstances should they base their investment decisions on the information                
contained in this document. Those persons or entities offering investment products to these potential investors are                
legally required to provide the information needed for them to take an appropriate investment decision. 

The content of this document is protected by intellectual property laws. Reproduction, transformation, distribution,              
public communication, making available, extraction, reuse, forwarding or use of any nature by any means or                
process is prohibited, except in cases where it is legally permitted or expressly authorised by BBVA. 
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